03N L W

10

11
12

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

22
23

24

25
26
27
28
29

30
31

32

HFAHBRS03 3999 2470

FOR OFFICE USE ONLY

HOUSE FLOOR AMENDMENTS
2022 Regular Session
Amendments proposed by Representative Gadberry to Engrossed House Bill No. 803 by
Representative Gadberry

AMENDMENT NO. 1

On page 1, delete lines 2 and 3 in their entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"To amend and reenact R.S. 40:1730.28(A)(3)(e) and (f) and (7), the heading of Part
IV-B of Chapter 8 of Title 40 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950,
1730.41 through 1730.45, and 1730.49(D) and (E)(1)(introductory
paragraph), (a), and (2), to enact R.S. 40:1730.22(F), 1730.28(A)(8),
1730.28.4, and 1730.28.5, and to repeal R.S. 40:1730.46 through 1730.48,
relative"

AMENDMENT NO. 2

On page 1, line 4, after "definitions;" and before "to" insert the following:

"to provide for the heading of Part IV-B of Chapter 8, of Title 40 of the
Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950;"

AMENDMENT NO. 3

On page 1, delete lines 9 through 11 in their entirety and insert in lieu thereof the following:

"Section 1. R.S. 40:1730.28(A)(3)(e) and (f) and (7), the heading of Part IV-
B of Chapter 8 of Title 40 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes of 1950, 1730.41
through 1730.45, and 1730.49(D) and (E)(1)(introductory paragraph), (a), and (2) are
hereby amended and reenacted and R.S. 40:1730.22(F), 1730.28(A)(8), 1730.28.4,
and 1730.28.5 are hereby enacted to read as follows:"

AMENDMENT NO. 4

On page 1, between lines 11 and 12, insert the following:

"§1730.22. Louisiana State Uniform Construction Code Council; membership;
function of council; meeting requirements; immunity

* * *

F.(1) Training and technical assistance in the implementation of the
Louisiana State Uniform Construction Code residential and commercial building
energy code provisions shall be the responsibility of the technology assessment
division of the Department of Natural Resources in collaboration with the council,
as provided for in Subsection C of this Section.

(2) The technology assessment division of the Department of Natural
Resources shall continue training and technical assistance as funding allows.

% % LAl

Page 1 of 4

CODING: Words in struck-through type are deletions from existing law; words underscored
are additions.



10

11

12

13
14

15

16

17

18

19
20

21

22

23
24

25
26
27

28
29
30
31

32
33
34
35

HFAHBRS03 3999 2470

AMENDMENT NO. 5

On page 2, between lines 16 and 17, insert the following:

"§1730.28.4. Energy Code Commission: members; purpose; procedure; termination

A. The Energy Code Commission, hereinafter referred to as the
"commission", is hereby created and shall be composed of the following voting
members:

(1) A designee of the Louisiana Home Builders Association.

(2) A designee of the Building Officials Association of Louisiana, Inc.

(3) A designee of the AIA Louisiana, the Louisiana Architects Association.

(4) A designee of the New Orleans ASHRAE Chapter.

(5) A designee of the Apartment Association of Louisiana.

(6) A designee of the Greater New Orleans Housing Alliance.

(7) A designee of the Associated Builders and Contractors, Inc., Louisiana
Chapter.

(8) A designee of the Laborers' International Union of North America.

(9) A designee who is a Louisiana registered RESNET HERS rater.

(10) A designee of the HVACR Association of Louisiana.

(11) A designee of the Louisiana Associated General Contractors, Inc.

B. In addition to the voting members of the commission, the commission
shall be composed of the following nonvoting members:

(1) A designee of the Louisiana Department of Natural Resources.

(2) A designee of the division of administration.

(3) The Department of Public Safety and Corrections, Louisiana State
Uniform Construction Code Council Technical Committee chairperson.

C. Each of the entities named in Subsections A and B of this Section shall
submit the name of the entity's designee to the chairman of the council on or before
August 1, 2022.

D. The term of each member of the commission shall end upon the adoption
of the 2021 International Energy Conservation Code as provided by R.S.
40:1730.28(7) pursuant to the council's authority to promulgate rules in accordance
with the Administrative Procedure Act, R.S. 49:950 et seq.

E.(1) The primary function of the commission shall be to provide
amendments to the code delineated in R.S. 40:1730.28.5 in order to address energy
efficiency requirements to reduce the long-term energy cost burden for building
occupants in this state.

Page 2 of 4

CODING: Words in struck-through type are deletions from existing law; words underscored
are additions.



W N =

NN D b

o0

10
11
12
13
14

15
16

17
18

19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29

30
31

32

33

34
35

36
37
38

39
40

HFAHBRS03 3999 2470

(2) A vote on proposed amendments shall take place only when a quorum
of the commission members is present. A simple majority of the commission shall
constitute a quorum.

(3) The commission shall provide amendments to the council that have been
approved by a majority vote of the total members of the commission present and
voting and those amendments shall be included in the provisions of the code adopted
by the council pursuant to R.S. 40:1730.28.5.

§1730.28.5. Mandatory adoption of the energy code provisions of certain nationally
recognized codes and standards; amendments; effective date

A. Notwithstanding R.S. 40:1730.28, the council shall evaluate, adopt, and
amend the latest editions of the following as part of the State Uniform Construction
Code:

(1) The International Energy Conservation Code.

(2) The International Residential Code, Part IV Energy Efficiency.

B. The codes listed in Subsection A of this Section as adopted by the council
shall become effective July 1, 2023.

C.(1) The commission shall provide the council with amendments to include
in the energy code provisions adopted pursuant to this Section.

(2) The council shall adopt only amendments to the energy code provisions
adopted pursuant to this Subsection that are provided by the commission pursuant
to R.S. 40:1730.28.4(E)(3).

(3) The council shall include amendments which are provided pursuant to
Paragraph (2) of this Subsection in the energy efficiency provisions adopted pursuant
to this Section.

(4) The council shall be in receipt of all amendments from the commission
to be included in the energy efficiency provisions to be adopted pursuant to this
Section by December 31, 2022, and the commission shall not provide any further
amendments to the council after this date.

* * *

PART IV-C. COMMERCEIAE STATE BUILDING ENERGY
CONSERVATION CODE"

AMENDMENT NO. 6

On page 4, delete lines 3 and 4 in their entirety and insert the following:

"§1730.45. Adoption of Commeretal Buildmg Energy Consery
Building Energy Conservation Code; enforcement; rules"

AMENDMENT NO. 7

On page 4, delete lines 9 and 10 in their entirety and insert in lieu there of the following:

"Louisiana State Uniform Construction Code Council, as defined by R.S.
1730.28(A), with state amendments, is hereby adopted as the State Building Energy
Conservation Code."

Page 3 of 4

CODING: Words in struck-through type are deletions from existing law; words underscored
are additions.



HFAHBRS03 3999 2470

AMENDMENT NO. 8

On page 5, delete lines 13 through 28 in their entirety

AMENDMENT NO. 9

Delete pages 6 and 7 in its entirety

AMENDMENT NO. 10

On page 8, delete lines 1 through 20 in their entirety

AMENDMENT NO. 11

On page 9, after line 18, add the following:

"Section 2. R.S. 40:1730.46 through 1730.48 are hereby repealed in their
entirety."

Page 4 of 4

CODING: Words in struck-through type are deletions from existing law; words underscored
are additions.



