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Proposed law repeals current law regarding registration of home service contract providers with the Secretary of State.
Proposed law provides for the regulations of home service contract providers by the Commissioner of Insurance/LA
Department of Insurance as follows: registration requirements; fees; expiration and renewal of registration; disclosures in
contracts; cancellation of contracts; required recordkeeping; enforcement and authorized examination; prohibited acts;
suspension or revocation of registration; and penalties. Proposed law provides that the Commissioner of Insurance shall
collect fees: (1) $600 for initial registration, and (2) $250 for a 2-year renewal. Proposed law authorizes enforcement by the
Commissioner as follows: (1) cease and desist orders for violations, (2) issue an order prohibiting selling; (3) revoke or
suspend registration; (4) impose civil penalties up to $500 per violation, not to exceed $10,000 in the aggregate for all
violations.

Proposed law is not anticipated to result in a material impact on expenditures within the Secretary of State or the LA
Department of Insurance (LDI). The proposed law transfers the registration of information and security requirements of
home service contract providers from the Secretary of State to LDI. In addition, the proposed law authorizes the
Commissioner to conduct examinations and reviews as well as enforcement, which includes the following: issue cease and
desist orders, prohibit selling or offering contacts, revoke or suspend certificates of authority to operate; and assess civil
penalties.

The Secretary of State may experience a minimal workload decrease as it will no longer have to register and receive surety
bonds from approximately 131 home service contract providers. LDI anticipates any workload increase associated with
registration applications and financial security deposit/surety bonds will be handled with existing staff and resources. To the
extent LDI experiences increased enforcement activities, the LFO anticipates revenue from registration fees and civil
penalties will be utilized to mitigate any increased workload.

Note: Under the proposed law, home service contracts are still not considered insurance and are not regulated under the LA
Insurance Code except for provisions of this measure.

Proposed law will have an indeterminable impact on SGR collections in the Department of Insurance. The proposed law
authorizes the Commissioner of Insurance to impose penalties not to exceed $500 per violation or $10,000 in the aggregate
on home service contract providers that violate provisions of this measure. The LFO anticipates any civil penalties assessed
and collected will be used to mitigate enforcement expenses. The LFO cannot determine the number and cost of penalties
that would be assessed under this measure or anticipate the amount of revenue collected by the Department of Insurance
from penalties in future fiscal years.

The initial registration fee of $600 and renewal fee (every two years) remain the same. Therefore, revenue from registration
fees will not change but will be collected by LDI instead of the Secretary of State. The Secretary of State reports collecting
$62,340 in revenue from registration fees in FY 23.
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