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There is no anticipated direct material effect on governmental expenditures as a result of this measure.  The bill’s general
requirements relative to development and implementation of a statewide common course numbering system are unchanged
since the passage of Act 356 (SB 285) of the 2009 Regular Legislative Session.  The proposed legislation delays the
implementation deadlines related to common course numbering and content of common courses.  The Board of Regents can
supply the additional information for the House and Senate education committees required by the bill with existing staff and
resources.

NOTE:  Although the bill itself has no material effect on expenditures, the Board of Regents estimates costs of $465,000 in
Fiscal Year 2012-13 to implement common course numbering and establish links to matching courses from affected campus
student information systems statewide.  These estimated implementation costs include the following:

1.  $330,000 for computer system modifications of 33 unique student information systems at the Board of Regents and
institution campuses statewide.
2.  $75,000 for professional services to develop and implement a web-based query tool for the common course numbering
system.
3.  $60,000 for travel for faculty representatives from 32 campuses statewide to develop the common course numbering
system.

To date, the Board of Regents has not received a legislative appropriation to fund development and implementation of a
statewide common course numbering system.  Efforts by Regents to date have been accomplished with the board’s existing
staff and resources.

Present law requires the implementation of a statewide common course numbering system as follows: (1) All courses for
associate degrees by the beginning of the 2010-2011 academic year. (2) All lower division courses by the end of the 2011
-2012 academic year. (3) All undergraduate courses by the end of the 2011-2012 academic year. Proposed law changes
implementation dates of the required statewide common course numbering system for postsecondary education as follows:
(1) All courses contained in the Board of Regents' general education core curriculum by the beginning of the 2012-2013
academic year. (2) All courses required for completion of the associate degrees by the beginning of the 2013-2014 academic
year. (3) All remaining lower division courses by the beginning of the 2014-2015 academic year. (4) All remaining 
undergraduate courses by the end of the 2015-2016 academic year.  Proposed law adds items to a written report required by
the Board of Regents to the Senate and House committees on education.  Effective upon signature of governor or lapse of
time for gubernatorial action.

There is no anticipated direct material effect on governmental revenues as a result of this measure.
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